
 

Purchasing Division of Legal Department 

INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM 

             

  Stacy Nonhof, Purchasing Agent 

 
Working Together for a 

                     Better Tomorrow, Today 

 

 

 BID OPENING 

 

BID OPENING DATE:  February 16, 2021 at 2:00 p.m. 

 

FOR:     Veteran’s Home Cemetery Maintenance 

 

DEPARTMENT:   Parks and Recreation 

 

ESTIMATE:    $30,000.00 

 

FUND/ACCOUNT:   10044405-95390 

 

PUBLICATION DATE:  January 24, 2021 

 

NO. POTENTIAL BIDDERS: 7 

 

 SUMMARY 

 

Bidder:  Lawnscape      AB Service and Repair, LLC 

   Grand Island, NE     Grand Island, NE 

Exceptions:  Noted       None 

 

Bid Price: 

Mowing:  $725.00      $500.00 

Trimming:  Included      Included 

Fertilizing:  $1,950.00      $750.00 

Grounds Litter: Included      $  20.00 

Trash Disposal: Included      Included 

Winterize Irrig: $250.00      No Bid 

Spring Irrig. Test: $150.00      No Bid 

Aerification:  $350.00      $350.00 

Apply Mulch:  $125.00      $100.00 

Pre-emergent: Included      $700.00 

Grub Control: $250.00      $800.00 

Fungicide:  $225.00      $700.00 

Over-seeding: $ .45 per sq ft.     $0.45 sq ft 

Broadleaf Weed: Included      $500.00 

Reset Headstones: $65.00 each      No Bid 

Backflow Test: $55.00 each      No Bid 



 

 

Bidder:  GMP Fertilizing & Lawncare   Meadowlark Lawn/Landscaping 

   Grand Island, NE     Grand Island, NE 

Exceptions:  None       Noted 

 

Bid Price: 

Mowing:  $   450.00      $377.85 

Trimming:  $   250.00      $169.50 

Fertilizing:  $1,500.00      $777.00 

Grounds Litter: $     30.00      $  27.50 

Trash Disposal: $     25.00      $  20.00 

Winterize Irrig: NA       No Bid 

Spring Irrig. Test: NA       No Bid 

Aerification:  $   500.00      $480.00 

Apply Mulch:  $   105.00      $  93.00 

Pre-emergent: $1,500.00      $877.50 

Grub Control: $1,500.00      $775.00 

Fungicide:  $1,400.00      $735.00 

Over-seeding: $         .45      $      .40 

Broadleaf Weed: $    900.00      $565.00 

Reset Headstones: NA       No Bid 

Backflow Test: NA       No Bid 

 

 

 

 

cc: Todd McCoy, Parks & Recreation Director   Patti Buettner, Parks Admin. Assist. 

 Jerry Janulewicz, City Administrator    Patrick Brown, Finance Director 

 Stacy Nonhof, Purchasing Agent     

P2250 


