
 

Purchasing Division of Legal Department 
INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM 

             
  Jason Eley, Purchasing Agent 

 
Working Together for a 

                     Better Tomorrow, Today 
 
 
 BID OPENING 
 
BID OPENING DATE:  July 26, 2012 at 2:15 p.m. 
 
FOR:     2012 or Newer, Heavy Duty Rescue/Pumper 
 
DEPARTMENT:   Fire 
 
ESTIMATE:    $585,000.00 
 
FUND/ACCOUNT:   10022101-85625 
 
PUBLICATION DATE:  July 6, 2012 
 
NO. POTENTIAL BIDDERS: 10 
 
 
 SUMMARY 
 
Bidder:  Rosenbauer South Dakota   Ed M. Feld Equipment Co., Inc. 
   Lyons, SD     Carroll, IA 
Bid Security:  Travelers Casualty & Surety Co.  Merchants Bonding Co. 
Exceptions:  None      None 
 
Bid Price:  $532,193.00     No Bid 
Discount:  $   -7,577.00     No Bid 
Option 1:      No Bid     $2,695.00 
Option 2:      No Bid     $   990.00 each 
Option 3:      No Bid     $3,340.00 
Option 4:  $ 22,995.00     No Bid 
Total Bid:  $547,611.00 
 
 
Bidder:  Danko Emergency Equipment  Toyne 
   Snyder, NE     Breda, IA 
Bid Security:  Travelers Casualty & Surety Co.  North American Specialty Ins. Co. 
Exceptions:  None      Noted 
 
Bid Price:  $472,330.00     $486,640.50 
Discount:  $ -11,730.00     $  -9,742.00 
Option 1:  $    1,908.00     $   2,400.00 
Option 2:  $    1,193.00     $   1,796.00 
Option 3:  $   3,795.00     $   3,500.00 



Option 4:  $  35,632.00     $ 26,700.00 
Total Bid:  $503,128.00     $511,294.50 
 
 
 
 
cc: Russ Blackburn, Interim Fire Chief    Tim Hiemer, Division Chief 
 Jason Eley, Purchasing Agent     Chris Hoffman, Fire Admin. Assist. 
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