
 

Purchasing Division of Legal Department 
INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM 

             
  Stacy Nonhof, Purchasing Agent 

 
Working Together for a 

                     Better Tomorrow, Today 
 
 
 BID OPENING 
 
BID OPENING DATE:  November 14, 2013 at 2:00 p.m. 
 
FOR:     Tree Trimming Contract 2014-TT-1 
 
DEPARTMENT:   Utilities 
 
ESTIMATE:    $150,000.00 
 
FUND/ACCOUNT:   520 
 
PUBLICATION DATE:  October 14, 2013 
 
NO. POTENTIAL BIDDERS: 10 
 
 SUMMARY 
 
Bidder:  Asplundh     Leetch Tree Service 
   Willow Grove, PA    Grand Island, NE 
Bid Security:  Travelers Casualty & Surety Co.  Western Surety Co. 
Exceptions:  Noted      None 
 
Bid Price: 
Section 1:  $40,425.00     $10,100.00 
Section 2:  $11,333.00     $  3,450.00 
Section 3:  $19,301.00     $12,400.00 
Section 4:  $  4,880.00     $  4,650.00 
Section 5:  $32,748.00     $10,725.00 
Section 6:  $16,086.00     $  7,850.00 
Section 7:  $11,585.00     $  5,950.00 
Section 8:  $20,105.00     $10,560.00 
Section 9:  $28,594.00     $18,950.00 
Section 10:  $17,474.00     $  5,940.00 
Total Price:  $202,531.00     $90,575.00 
 
 



 
 
Bidder:  Tom’s Tree Service 
   Grand Island, NE 
Bid Security:  Western Surety Co. 
Exceptions:  None 
 
Bid Price: 
Section 1:     No Bid 
Section 2:  $  7,000.00 
Section 3:  $11,000.00 
Section 4:  $  6,000.00 
Section 5:    No bid 
Section 6:  $  8,000.00 
Section 7:    No bid 
Section 8:  $  5,300.00 
Section 9:    No Bid 
Section 10:  $12,000.00 
Total Price:  $49,300.00 
 
 
cc: Tim Luchsinger, Utilities Director    Bob Smith, Assist. Utilities Director 
 Mary Lou Brown, City Administrator   Jaye Monter, Finance Director 
 Stacy Nonhof, Purchasing Agent    Pat Gericke, Utilities Admin. Assist. 
 Tom Barnes, Utilities Eng. Mgr. 
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